T |, S1.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Rd & a59A
Che Gazette of India

G1.50.-3N.Te.-31.-06072022-237129
CG-DL-E-06072022-237129

ETITIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT | |—E7e 3—=7-97% (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

TR & THTIT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 482) 7% fooeft, qEaATe, JTE 6, 2022/ STNTE 15, 1944
No. 482] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, JULY 6, 2022/ASHADHA 15, 1944

CILESCRIGC R E IR

I Ll
< faeeT, 6 S[eTs, 2022

ar.&.. 520(37).—argEe Faw, 1937 wfawa =i 1 anr genfaa # % o Aefated
T, TSI FMTedT &l ol G a1 Atert=ad, 1934 (1934 FT 22) #T &7 5 FIET Tacd AHIT &
TART A gC HIAT TEATEd Hdl &, Bl 69 TATAT g arel GHT FATET ARl & gaard 3ad
At AT aT=T 14 FRT TG TAgeT THI9d 36T ST g i TagRT 99471 &f STt g o 39
T AT 9% 9 & o, SreH 78 Afag=e=T T gt g, [ aiaat o7 sifehd e |
oo it srafer 3 are o= R STosm, o SHar # I9esy w8

AT AT GATE, T(R T2 l, TR AHHT AEIAR9F, THGEST garesig & qrad, 95 fdodll —
110003 =T Harfaa fohT ST 7 2 AT dgoffice.dgca@nic.in &1 0 FU ST T €;

I ITET FFAT & Fae § et |7 s7f<h # A7 7 Iugaq AHiEse sater § ager e g vt
ot o srfxy =T germe o7 F0T A g fAE T S

wTey fFaw
1. (1) = A=A AT I (... . eree) 7w, 2022 F=7 Srom)
(2) o s, FTRTEY TS H 3 T A A W TS gl
2. FrgAT =, 1937 #, -
) R 13 4, -

4574 G1/2022 )




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(i) el AT “OTEHET AT M58 Y, TH 58 T U ARR FHWT "qgriHeened grr
HAATH W& FATSAET 953 TET STUAT;
(i) AT AT AET oreat F T 9 AN AT AeTiHetad” ores T ST,
(@) e 38 &, 3u-ferr (1) #.-
() @ () F W e Feferfa g w@r e, ad;-
“(ST) ST sTeeraRt it ¥ie (A sie Fefisrreest & form);”
(i) @ () F v X et @ @ S, 959d;-

“() TTIAE T ATHE (TATSSI, SqAT, ATehAEe A9, dee Ted & qoum
ML & form);”

(@)l # fm 39w §, gu-fa (1) # -
(i)  FaH (3) § F7 "7 (i) F fowg, “Ii au” oz F ©I19 9 “T9 99 9768 T@T SITUAT;-
(i) = (3) H w7 GeAT (i) * Feg, ‘i au” o758 % T 9¥ “TH qU” 9765 T@T STUAT;-
() w42 ®, 39-Fam (1) % =00 g™ & v, Fefetea se-Fag e s, qma:-

() (1%). <TE F FAUTIAFT T T FA F T AR ST FE A i ST, ST
o weTRaers g Matfa it 12 2f, 37 degde Y 2w qur uraee iRt ==+ &
Tee T T ST

(i) (1=). Su-FFF (1F) ¥ SFaAfad srueArsti & TIaTd Hl GATHT AT Te®, TaraT
a7 =afeh it REHERT R &Y =6 38 & AqUTad & HIHaers® g arsad, e &
FATARTOT, ST ot HTHAT BT, F T9T FATAT FohAT SO,

(iiiy  (17r). =7 AT AT F forw, Srat e F AAA 0T T AFeTFHAr A6l g, I I9-FAW
(1%) ® Sfoaterd STTeATsl & AT, SAT<h TTAT AT I, ATATH il TGAT I AT
& FIF T4F T2 a9 § TS0 T &I 641 STom

(%) = 66 9 -
(i) S9-F (1) % ,-

(F) <53 “ToreT TaTer”, o ol 9161 “FIE THTLT Algd Ao Aved Hleed, (39T F13ed, oL
ATZE | AT ATAT ATZE ATAT AT Tohelt AT T |0 7 217 T@T SATUATT;

(@) @< (F) H, “5 FherHie” oreg & forw “oi= qifeswer greed” 9Tes T@T STUAT

(M =T (M) H, asx ‘T F o, A atw wea Jifewa Areen” oqss @r
STTUAT,

() ©T (F) F A |, IS “Hg AL, AN T ATl ST F oIk TTAT T AT<h i
FAAT I ARE F O 9% W7 7 AT 8T, SH @R A9 =ARE HT, e o
e e ST aTer U ST 99T % & Siaiid, T AT & (o1 TATAT SARerH
IUTAT T FEA STTAT THATAT & T W7 ¥ ST F TAT AT H TH TR AT 30T F
STAIH B &l U 6 TorT AT F2d g0 UF Aied qia HT Gl g7 & @
ZT;

(i) &< () F q=, MHACET G F T SST AT, ATH:----
“(F) ST AT % qIerd T 7 ST F7 Gl g FTET TATA AT T F gal
93T T qHAT B,




[¢TRT Hl—=ve 3(i)] T T TSI © T 3

(iii) < (F) F &=, [Heferied 975 1 ST STo, -

“FE ALHI AAAT Fg TLH G AR TGS § ATEAAT & qTeqq & ATiarha et
ZIF T ART A ATAT ST o AT TTAT T STk I TAAT IH <k [ O I AT
FT AT Bl, S TATHT A&7 =ik &1, Aifed § AfAfEe fro s arer v saes 997 %
AT, ST FATH 6 [oIT TATET ARITHT IUTAT Tl TRTA TATT | el qTAT AAST H TH
e o for, ==t gt Y o1y &7 wee ¥ forw Arfew arier w2 @ear 2171

(iv) ST-FAT (3) ©, 915 ‘U FILU & A9 |, AT LA T A1 ST 3T G AT, AT |
aaTied aer & |r suTerd g % fore “wfda Jifew # gurea Aeet & 79 ¥
FLATS FTT 9757 TET STUAT;

(v) s9-tFaw (4) % oo, Refetea s-Fag @ s, sma;-

“(4) Tt g AT TaT AT S8 T o\ &7 Haer o3 1 § 396 919 =9 T&h i
AT F TATAT T IULH FILT &, TSrEahT AT F2 &7 911 3% UL R, a8 AT 08T

FAAT THA & THTT, HEIH9F, AN AT F g0 gATSAET TATAF & [Haer 9T THh
T a7 T qHaAT 17

(vi) 3o (4) F TEma, Referted so-fae w@r s, 9ma;-

“(5) =z =I< TATHT (owner) ¥aT =t o =& =W & st Aifew arter T = &,
Tree & Ffua oTRr &7 FTAE we T AT STAAT TATAT & & fa@me it U7 F2am 8, Fx%
TLFHT ATAT Fg TLRTT FIT ITAFT Tl SATh IT T T T4 FT Tl g STl I¥ A0
g AT I THTT IHAT T HI, T AATALTT THATT Al HIT TAT ATAT & Aigal
& el Mg srore FRa Fad &t FRars TR F37 & o dafaq g 2oa §
AR it foare |t wam

(6) =tz Foreft AT % YA a1 T AT o S0d T 9dT Agl adT g TTaT SH T a0l
AT T ITART TR T | 81 8 STAAT 3TN F IS /T HA1d U 5978 F fFe grae
ALY STE ST &7 & AT ZATSAET TATAS ATAT TATATSH TATAd STAT ST ATHAT &, ATHA
T A Hated qrore 2o & e Fwan e & sy #3390 % o wrars s i
AT &€ |igar & srefir et g1, e it 57 99

(&) M=\ 67 F o, 3U-[A=W (6) #, 9Te7 ‘T & oI “TIThTee” TN T,
() STTIAT NI, -
() 9T FH, TUTE 9, IRRITE 10 & TT:HHAHd N,
(i) o7 T H, AR 4 ¥, G (1) F fow, el @ w@r S, -

“(T) TEgHE - SEgHE YA TARATEA SiEUle qEde ATeHd HT (8T gl T
AT gy TegHe YT AT 981 gy, qomty, sreEt |l & grer or § Ffafds
TUEATSA o SATATE AAHA AT SATTITI;
() AT VIE ®, TETE 2 H, qiferr 2 |, 7 4T 81 F A9, HiAH (2) H, q58 “Iu-HIq” F;T
T g

[T, §. TET -11012/1/2022-211]
qedig FHTE AT, S aft=a

foroquft : qor F=| aa F TSI, JETEn, 9T 1, @2 3, I-ET (i) H Ate=Ar geqr V-26 G iE
23 914, 1937 T THTAT gU o AT Sifaw a1 AL, 289(3), f&1 08 =i, 2022 & gIT
AT ZIohT TR o TSI, TETLTI, 9 |, €< 3, 39-82 (i) § TH1iera o o)




4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

MINISTRY OF CIVIL AVIATION
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 6th July, 2022

G.S.R. 520(E).—The following draft of certain rules further to amend the Aircraft Rules, 1937,
which the Central Government proposes to make in exercise of the powers conferred by section 5 of the
Aircraft Act, 1934 (22 of 1934), is hereby published as required by section 14 of the said Act, for
information of all persons likely to be affected thereby; and notice is hereby given that the said draft rules
will be taken into consideration after a period of thirty days from the date on which copies of the Gazette of
India, in which this notification is published, are made available to the public;

Objections or suggestions, if any, may be addressed to the Director-General of Civil Aviation,
Opposite Safdarjung Airport, New Delhi-110003 or mailed to dgoffice.dgca@nic.in;

Any objection or suggestion which may be received from any person with respect to the said draft
rules before the expiry of the period specified above will be considered by the Central Government.

Draft Rules
1. @ These rules may be called the Aircraft (........... Amendment) Rules, 2022.
(2 They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Aircraft Rules, 1937 —
(A) in rule 13,

(1) for the words “Government Aerodrome” wherever they occur, the words
“Aerodrome licensed by the Director-General of Civil Aviation” shall be
substituted:;

(i) for the words “Civil Aviation Department”, the words “ Directorate General of

Civil Aviation” shall be substituted;
(B) inrule 38, in sub-rule (1), —
(i) for clause (h), the following clause shall be substituted, namely; —
“(h) Flight Instructor’s Rating (for aeroplanes, helicopters);”
(ii) for clause (i), the following clause shall be substituted, namely;—

“(i) Pilot’s License (for gliders, balloons, microlight aircraft, light sport aircraft and
gyroplane);”

(C) in rule 39C, in sub-rule (1), in Table, —

(i) against serial number (i), in column (3), for the words “Five years” the words “Ten years”
shall be substituted:;

(i1) against serial number (ii), in column (3), for the words “Five years” the words “Ten
years” shall be substituted;

(D) in rule 42, after fourth proviso to sub-rule (1), the following sub —rules shall be inserted,
namely —

0] (1A). The requirements of competency and recency for exercising the privileges of the
licence, as prescribed by the Director-General, shall be completed before Instrument
rating test and Pilot Proficiency check;

(i) (1B). Ensuring compliance of requirements as mentioned above in sub-rule (1A) shall be
the responsibility of the Examiner, Operator or individual and such compliance would be
verified by the Director-General at the time of renewal of license, ratings, as the case may
be;

(iti) ~ (1C). For all other cases, where renewal of rating is not required, the compliance of
requirements as mentioned above in sub-rule (1A) shall be submitted to Director-General


mailto:dgoffice.dgca@nic.in

[¢TRT Hl—=ve 3(i)] T T TSI © T 5

by the individual or by the Operator, in every 2 % years during the validity period of the
license.

(E) inrule 66,—

(F

(i)

(i)

(iii)

(iv)

in sub-rule (1), —

(@) for the words “any light”, the words “any light including but not limited to the lights
from Lantern Kites, Wish Kites, Laser light or any other light” shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (a) , for the words “5 kilometres”, the words “five nautical miles” shall be
substituted:;

(c) in clause (c¢) , for the words “vicinity ” the words “vicinity of five nautical miles” shall
be substituted,;

(d) at the end of clause (d), the text “the Central Government may serve a notice upon the
owner or person in possession of the place where the light is exhibited or upon the
person having charge of the light, directing that owner or person, within a reasonable
time to be specified in the notice, to take effectual means for extinguishing or for
effectually screening the light and for preventing for the future the exhibition of any
similar light” shall be omitted;

after clause (d) , the following clause shall be inserted, namely:----

“(e) which may disrupt safe operation of the aircraft or may pose hazard to the operating
Crew.;

after clause (e) , the following text shall be inserted, namely: ----

“the Central Government. or any person authorised by the Central Government through
notification in Official Gazette, may serve a notice upon the owner or person in possession
of the place where the light is exhibited or upon the person having charge of the light,
directing the owner or person to take effectual means for extinguishing or for effectually
screening the light with immediate effect and for preventing for the future, the exhibition
of any similar light.”.

in sub-rule (3), for the words “ in the absence of reasonable cause, the burden of proving
which shall be upon him, comply with the direction contained in the notice.” the words
“immediately act in accordance with the directions contained in the said notice.” shall be
substituted;

(v) for the sub rule (4), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely;—

(vi)

“(4) In case the owner or person who has been directed to extinguish the light has any
reasonable cause to operate such light, the burden of proving which shall be upon him,
may, after extinguishing or stopping exhibition of lights, submit an appeal from the
directions of Airport Operator, to the Director General of Civil Aviation.”

after sub-rule (4) , the following sub-rules shall be inserted, namely:—

“(5) If any owner or person on whom a notice under this rule is served, neglects for a
period of twenty four hour to extinguish or effectually to screen the light mentioned in the
notice, the Central Government. or any person authorised by the Central Government may
enter upon the place where the light is and forthwith extinguish the same, doing no
unnecessary damage and may also report the matter to the concerned police station for
initiating the action of commission of offence as provided under the Indian Penal Code.

(6) In case the source of the light observed by the Operating crew of any aircraft is not
located or the use of such light is not from a determined place or the source of emission of
light is shifting from one place to another then the Airport Operator or the Airline Operator
as the case may be, shall immediately report the matter to the concerned police station so as
to initiate action for commission of offence as provided under the Indian Penal Code.”;

in rule 67A, in sub-rule (6), for the word “aeroplane”, the word “aircraft”, shall be substituted;



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(G) in Schedule 1l,—
(i) inSection A, the paragraph 9, shall be renumbered as paragraph 10;

(if) in Section M, , in paragraph 4, for clause (c),the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(c) Instrument Rating- The Instrument rating shall be part of the Airline Transport
Pilot License and therefore no separate Instrument Rating will be issued, however, the
Instrument Rating shall be renewed as per the requirements specified in Section ‘O’ of
Schedule 11.”;

(H) in Schedule VIB, in paragraph 2, in Table 2, against serial number 81, in column (2), the
words “sub-rule” shall be omitted.

[F. No. AV-11012/1/2022-DG]
SATYENDRA KUMAR MISHRA, Jt. Secy.

Note : The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, vide notification number V-26, dated the
23" March, 1937 and last amended vide G.S.R. 289(E), dated the 08" April, 2022 published in the
Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part Il, Section 3, Sub-section (i), dated the ogh April, 2022.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. v

KUMAR VERMA 33225752554




		2022-07-06T22:55:48+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




